[bookmark: _Hlk184981472][bookmark: _Hlk174953730]COMMISSION ACTION MATRIX – green
STRUCTURAL DESIGN/LATERAL FORCES (SD/LF) CODE ADVISORY COMMITTEE
2025 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE, TITLE 24, PART 10, 2024 INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE
AGENCY: OFFICE OF STATEWIDE HOSPITAL PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT, OSHPD 06/24
LEGEND:
CAC Actions: Approve, Disapprove, Approve as Amended, Further Study Required
Agency Responses: Accept, Disagree, Withdraw
CBSC Actions: Approve, Disapprove, Approve as Amended, Further Study Required
[bookmark: _Hlk51752204]Matrix Paper Color (for commission action only): GREEN = uncontested items, YELLOW = challenged items, SALMON = withdrawn, no action required
[bookmark: _Hlk51751202]If using assistive technology, please adjust your settings to recognize underline, strikeout, italic and ellipsis.
· Model Code language appears upright
· Existing California amendments appear in italic
· Amended model code or new California amendments appear underlined & italic
· Repealed model code language appears upright and in strikeout
· Repealed California amendments appear in italic and strikeout
· Ellipses (…) indicate existing text remains unchanged
ITEM 1
Chapter 1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION, DIVISION I CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATION
[bookmark: _Hlk164340821]Adopt the 2025 CEBC Chapter 1 Division I, for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6. 
Carry forward existing amendments of the 2022 CEBC for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4 and 5 with modifications in sections listed below.
	OSHPD 06/24
ITEM 1
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	1-1
	1.1.1 Title.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Update the year of the model code being adopted in this cycle from 2021 IEBC to 2024 IEBC.
	

	1-2
	1.10  Department of Health Care Access and Information/Office of Statewide Health Hospital Planning and Development
	Approve
	Disagree
	No public comments received.
	Editorial modification to reflect change in organization name of the OSHPD.
Post CAC: OSHPD added HCAI to the title.
	

	1-3
	1.10.1 OSHPD 1 and OSHPD 1R.
	Approve
	Disagree
	No public comments received.
	Editorial modification to reflect change in organization name of the OSHPD. Clarification that OSHPD enforces energy regulations by the California Energy Commission (CEC).
Post CAC:  OSHPD added HCAI to enforcing agency.
	

	1-4
	1.10.1.1 Applicable administrative standards.
	Further Study Required
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Clarification that administrative provisions of the CEBC are adopted by OSHPD.
CAC: Further Study Required under criteria #1. Inappropriate referral to MAT.
OSHPD: ET amended per CAC recommendations.
	

	1-5
	1.10.1.2 Applicable building standards.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Clarification which chapters are adopted for OSHPD 1.
	

	1-6
	1.10.1.4 Reference to other chapters.
	Approve
	Disagree
	No public comments received.
	Clarification that reference to non “A” chapters of CEBC in any part of Title 24 shall imply reference to the corresponding “A” chapters in the CEBC, when applicable.
Post CAC: OSHPD removed the CBSC acronym.
	

	1-7
	1.10.2 OSHPD 2.
	Approve
	Disagree
	No public comments received.
	Editorial modification to reflect change in organization name of the OSHPD. Clarification that OSHPD enforces energy regulations by CEC.
Post CAC: OSHPD added HCAI to enforcing agency.
	

	1-8
	1.10.2.1 Applicable administrative standards.
	Further Study Required
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Clarification that administrative provisions of the CEBC are adopted by OSHPD.
CAC: Further Study Required under criteria #1.  Inappropriate referral to MAT.
OSHPD: ET amended per CAC recommendations.
	

	1-9
	1.10.2.2 Applicable building standards.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Clarification which chapters are adopted for OSHPD 2.
	

	1-10
	1.10.3.1 Applicable administrative standards.
	Further Study Required
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Clarification that administrative provisions of the CEBC are adopted by OSHPD.
CAC: Further Study Required under criteria #1.  Inappropriate referral to MAT.
OSHPD: ET amended per CAC recommendations.
	

	1-11
	1.10.3.2 Applicable building standards.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Clarification which chapters are adopted for OSHPD 3.
	

	1-12
	1.10.4 OSHPD 4.
	Approve
	Disagree
	No public comments received.
	Editorial modification to reflect change in organization name of the OSHPD. Clarification that OSHPD enforces energy regulations by CEC.
Post CAC: OSHPD added HCAI to enforcing agency.
	

	1-13
	1.10.4.1 Applicable administrative standards.
	Further Study Required
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Clarification that administrative provisions of the CEBC are adopted by OSHPD.
CAC: Further Study Required under criteria #1.  Inappropriate referral to MAT.
OSHPD: ET amended per CAC recommendations.
	

	1-14
	1.10.4.2 Applicable building standards.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Clarification which chapters are adopted for OSHPD 4.
	

	1-15
	1.10.5 OSHPD 5.
	Approve
	Disagree
	No public comments received.
	Editorial modification to reflect change in organization name of the OSHPD. Clarification that OSHPD enforces energy regulations by CEC.
Post CAC: OSHPD added HCAI to enforcing agency.
	

	1-16
	1.10.5.1 Applicable administrative standards.
	Further Study Required
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Clarification that administrative provisions of the CEBC are adopted by OSHPD.
CAC: Further Study Required under criteria #1.  Inappropriate referral to MAT.
OSHPD: ET amended per CAC recommendations.
	

	1-17
	1.10.5.2 Applicable building standards.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Clarification which chapters are adopted for OSHPD 5 and correct Part 2 to Part 10.
	

	1-18
	1.10.6 OSHPD 6.
1.10.6.1
1.10.6.2
1.10.6.3
	Further Study Required
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Sections added to align requirements with statutory change in Health and Safety Code Section 1250.3.
CAC: Further Study Required under criteria #1.  Inappropriate referral to MAT.
OSHPD: ET amended per CAC recommendations.
	


ITEM 2
Chapter 1, DIVISION II SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION
Adopt the 2024 IEBC Chapter 1, Sections 102.1 through 102.5 and 104.1 through 404.9 for OSHPD 1R, 2, 4, and 5. 
Carry forward existing amendments of the 2022 CEBC for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 4 and 5 with modifications in sections listed below.
	OSHPD 06/24
ITEM 2
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	2-1
	107.1 General.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Clarified that only one extension is permitted for temporary uses of equipment and systems.
	


ITEM 3
Chapter 2 DEFINITIONS
Adopt 2024 IEBC Chapter 2 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 3, 4, 5 and 6. 
Carry forward existing amendments of the 2022 CEBC for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 4 and 5 with modifications in sections listed below.
	OSHPD 06/24
ITEM 3
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	3-1
	201.1 Scope.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Amendment in Section 201.1 is moved to Section 201.3 for proper grouping.
	

	3-2
	201.3 Terms defined in other codes.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Amendment in Section 201.1 is moved to Section 201.3 for proper grouping. Editorial changes to use plain language.
	

	3-3
	INCIDENTAL STRUCTURAL ALTERATIONS, ADDITIONS OR REPAIRS.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Applicability of the definition for various OSHPD building types is revised to align with the use.
	

	3-4
	MAJOR STRUCTURAL ALTERATIONS, ADDITIONS OR REPAIRS.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Applicability of the definition for various OSHPD building types is revised to align with the use.
	

	3-5
	MINOR STRUCTURAL ALTERATIONS, ADDITIONS OR REPAIRS.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Applicability of the definition for various OSHPD building types is revised to align with the use.
	

	3-6
	NONSTRUCTURAL ALTERATION.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Applicability of the definition for various OSHPD building types is revised to align with the use.
	

	3-7
	UNREINFORCED MASONRY.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Applicability of the definition for various OSHPD building types is revised to align with the use.
	

	3-8
	VOLUNTARY STRUCTURAL IMPROVEMENTS (VSIs).
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Applicability of the definition for various OSHPD building types is revised to align with the use.
	


ITEM 4
Chapter 3 PROVISIONS FOR ALL COMPLIANCE METHODS
Adopt the 2024 IEBC Chapter 3 for OSHPD 3 and 6. Adopt only Sections 301.1 through 301.3.1, 301.1 Exception 5, 301.3, 301.3.1 Exception, 302, 304 through 305 for OSHPD 1R, 2, 4 and 5. OSHPD does not adopt Section 306. Adopt Sections 310 through 311 for OSHPD 1R, 2, and 5. Adopt Section 312 for OSHPD 1R. 
Carry forward existing amendments of the 2022 CEBC for OSHPD 1R, 2, 4 and 5.
	OSHPD 06/24
ITEM 4
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	4-3
	304.3.3 Criteria for Incidental and minor structural alteration, additions, or repairs of pre-1973 code buildings.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Provisions for incidental and minor alteration are added pursuant to statutory mandate.
	

	4-4
	310.1 Services/systems and utilities. 
311.1.1 Jurisdiction.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Editorial modification to reflect change in organization name of the OSHPD.
	

	4-5
	312.1 General.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Editorial modification to reflect change in organization name of the OSHPD. Minor editorial changes are for clarification only, no material change intended.
	

	4-6
	312.3.1 Freestanding buildings containing qualifying nonacute care services.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Permitting Chemical dependency recovery services is added pursuant to statutory mandate contained in Health and Safety Code Section 1250.3(f).
	

	4-7
	312.3.2 
312.3.3 
312.3.3.1
[bookmark: _Hlk158811086]312.3.3.2
[bookmark: _Hlk158810038]312.3.5
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Editorial changes are intended to satisfy statutory mandate for use of plain language.
	

	4-8
	312.3.6 Chemical dependency recovery services.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	New section recognizing that chemical dependency recovery services may be provided in a building that has been removed from general acute care pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section 1250.3(f).
	


ITEM 5
Chapter 3A PROVISIONS FOR ALL COMPLIANCE METHODS
Adopt the 2024 IEBC Chapter 3 as Chapter 3A of the 2025 CEBC for OSHPD 1. Carry forward existing amendments of the 2022 CEBC with modifications in sections listed below.
	OSHPD 06/24
ITEM 5
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	5-2
	301A.11 Hospital buildings removed from general acute care services.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Redundant pointer to an incorrect section is deleted. Hospital buildings removed from the general acute care services are outside the scope of this chapter.
	

	5-3
	302A.3.1 Existing seismic force-resisting systems.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Reference is corrected to point to the CBC for seismic coefficients since they are not provided in the CEBC.
	

	5-4
	304A.3.1.1 
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Deleted comma for proper continuity of the sentence.
	

	5-5
	304A.3.4 Performance objectives of performance-based methods.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Revised to permit use of ASCE 41-23 for all OSHPD 1 buildings. SPC-2 and SPC-4D buildings are permitted to use ASCE 41-13. Reference is corrected to point to CBC for non-seismic loads.
	

	5-6
	304A.3.4.1 For general acute care hospital …
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Section references are updated for consistency with ASCE 41-23.
	

	5-7
	304A.3.4.2
	Further Study Required
	Disagree
	No public comments received.
	Revised to permit continued use of ASCE 41-13 for SPC-2 buildings. Incorrect collapse prevention building performance state is corrected to (S-5).
CAC: Further Study Required under criteria #6. CAC suggests wordsmith and consider adding ASCE 41-13 at the beginning of the sentence.
OSHPD: No changes in ET have been made. Adding ASCE 41-13 to the beginning of the sentence for this section only creates inconsistencies with how the other subsection headers within this section are described.
	

	5-8
	304A.3.4.3 All other hospital buildings:
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	References are updated for consistency with ASCE 41-23.
	

	5-9
	304A.3.4.4 SPC 2 using ASCE 41-13.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Revised to permit continued use of ASCE 41-13 for SPC-2 buildings.
	

	5-10
	304A.3.4.5 SPC-4D using ASCE 41-13.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Revised to clarify that ASCE 41-13 requirements apply for SPC-4D upgrades.
	

	5-11
	304A.3.4.6 SPC 5 using ASCE 41-23.
304A.3.4.8 NPC-4 or NPC 4D and NPC-5 using ASCE 41-23:
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Pointers to ASCE 41 sections are revised for consistency with ASCE 41-23.
	

	5-12
	[bookmark: _Hlk167211407]304A.3.4.7 NPC-2 and NPC-3 using ASCE 41-23:
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Clarified that ASCE 41-23 is adopted in this section. 
	

	5-13
	304A.3.5 Modifications to ASCE 41-13 for SPC-2 and SPC-4D.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Revised to clarify that ASCE 41-13 is only permitted for evaluations and retrofits of SPC-2 and SPC-4D retrofits and evaluations. 
	

	5-14
	[bookmark: _Hlk167211475]304A.3.5.1 ASCE 41-13 …
304A.3.5.2 ASCE 41-13 …
304A.3.5.3 ASCE 41-13 …
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Clarified that the modifications to the reference standard, refers to ASCE 41-13.
	

	5-15
	[bookmark: _Hlk167211592]304A.3.5.4 ASCE 41-13 Section 7.2.8.1.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	New section added. 
	

	5-16
	304A.3.5.65 ASCE 41-13 … through 304A.3.5.1716 ASCE 41-13 …
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Renumbered to accommodate new section added. Clarified that the modifications to the reference standard, refers to ASCE 41-13.
	

	5-17
	304A.3.6 Modifications to ASCE 41-23.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	New section added by duplicating relevant existing regulations in section 304A.3.5 and modifying them slightly to address these requirements are for ASCE 41-23.
	

	5-18
	304A.3.6.1 ASCE 41-23 Section 2.1.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Section number is revised to align with ASCE 41-23, no material change intended.
	

	5-19
	304.5.6.2 ASCE 41-23 Section 6.2.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Existing amendment for data collection requirements is retained, no material change intended.
	

	5-20
	304A.3.6.3 ASCE 41-23 Section 7.2.9.1.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Clarified that ASCE 41-23 Equation 7-6 can be used to satisfy the adequacy of hold-downs in single-story light frame construction similar to amendment in Section 304A.3.5.4.
	

	5-21
	[bookmark: _Hlk159838619]304A.3.6.4 ASCE 41-23 Section 7.5.1.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Existing amendment for drift limit is retained, no material change intended.
	

	5-22
	304A.3.6.5 ASCE 41-23 Section 7.5.1.4.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Existing amendment for expected material properties is retained, no material change intended.
	

	5-23
	304A.3.6.6 ASCE 41-23 Section 8.6.1.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Existing amendment is retained, no material change intended.
	

	5-24
	304A.3.6.7 ASCE 41-23 Section 8.7.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Existing amendment for seismic increment of earth pressure is retained, no material change intended.
	

	5-25
	[bookmark: _Hlk159845945]304A.3.6.8 ASCE 41-23 Section 11.1.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Existing amendment is retained, no material change intended.
	

	5-26
	304A.3.6.9 ASCE 41-23 Chapter 16 and 17.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Existing amendment is retained, no material change intended.
	

	5-27
	310A.1.1.1.5 Buildings removed from acute-care hospital service.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Editorial change intended to satisfy statutory mandate on use of plain language.
	

	5-28
	311A.1.1.1.1 
311A.1.1.1.2
311A.1.1.1.3
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Code references are corrected to point to new building provisions in the California Building Code.
	


ITEM 6
Chapter 4 REPAIRS
Adopt the 2024 IEBC Chapter 4 for OSHPD 3 and 6. Adopt the 2024 IEBC Chapter 4 for OSHPD 1R, 2, 4 and 5. Section 406 not adopted for 1R, 2, 4 and 5.
Carry forward existing amendments of the 2022 CEBC for OSHPD 1R, 2, 4 and 5 with modifications in sections listed below. 
	OSHPD 06/24
ITEM 6
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	6-1
	401.1 Scope.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Editorial change intended to satisfy statutory mandate on use of plain language.
	


ITEM 7
Chapter 4A REPAIRS
Adopt the 2024 IEBC Chapter 4 as Chapter 4A of the 2025 CEBC for OSHPD 1. Carry forward existing amendments of the 2022 CEBC with modifications in sections listed below.
	OSHPD 06/24
ITEM 7
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	7-2
	401A.3 Flood hazard …
405A.1 General.
405A.2.1 Repairs for …
405A.2.3 Substantial …
405A.2.3.1 Evaluation.
405A.2.3.3 Extent of …
405A.2.4 Substantial …
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	OSHPD amendments to these sections are picked-up by the model code, hence OSHPD amendments are deleted. In Section 405A.2.3.3, lower limit for seismic load is reduced to 75% of new building design earthquake forces for consistency with ASCE 41 requirements.
	

	7-3
	[bookmark: _Hlk167212534]405A.2.4.1 Lateral force-resisting elements.
[bookmark: _Hlk167212555]405A.2.6 Flood hazard areas.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Language is revised to align with model code. Existing amendments are repealed.
	

	7-4
	407.2 Mechanical draft systems 
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	OSHPD does not adopt (or print) 407.2 for the A chapter. 
	

	7-5
	408A.2 Water closet replacement.  Exception
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	OSHPD does not adopt (or print) the exception in 408.2 for the A chapter.
	


ITEM 8
Chapter 5 PRESCRIPTIVE COMPLIANCE METHOD
Adopt the 2024 IEBC Chapter 5 for OSHPD 3 and 6. Adopt only Sections 501, 502, 503, 504, 505 and 506 for OSHPD 1R, 2, 4 and 5. 
Carry forward existing amendments of the 2022 CEBC for OSHPD 1R, 2, 4 and 5 with modifications in sections listed below.
	OSHPD 06/24
ITEM 8
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	8-1
	502.1 General.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Limitation of structural requirements to Sections 502.2 - 502.3 is removed since it conflicts with other sections.
	


ITEM 9
Chapter 5A PRESCRIPTIVE COMPLIANCE METHOD
Adopt the 2024 IEBC Chapter 5 as Chapter 5A of the 2025 CEBC for OSHPD 1. Carry forward existing amendments of the 2022 CEBC with modifications in sections listed below.
	OSHPD 06/24
ITEM 9
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	9-2
	501A.1.1 Compliance with other methods.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Section reference is corrected for proper reference to sections applicable to OSHPD 1 buildings.
	

	9-3
	501A.3.1 Prescriptive compliance provisions for SPC-4D …
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Revised references in exceptions to correct years they are associated with.
	

	9-4
	502A.1 General.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	References to Sections 502.2 through 502.3 are deleted since they conflict with other sections.
	

	9-5
	[bookmark: _Hlk167212779]502A.1.1 
502A.1.2
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Revised section numbers and referenced sections to point to “A” Chapters.
	

	9-6
	502A.2 Flood hazard areas. 
502A.3 …
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Amendments in existing Section 502A.3 are retained in new Section 502A.2. Amendments in former Section 502A.3 are deleted since they are picked up by model code in Section 502.2. Exception for Group R is deleted.
	

	9-7
	502A.3 Existing structural elements carrying gravity load. 
502A.4 …
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Amendments in existing Section 502A.4 are deleted since they are picked up by model code in Section 502.3. Exception for Group R is deleted.
	

	9-8
	502A.4.1 Design live load.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Section is deleted because it is a duplicate of Section 304A.1.
	

	9-9
	502A.4 [formerly 502A.5] Existing structural elements carrying lateral load.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Updated with existing amendments in Section 502A.5 to align with new format in IEBC 2024.  Exception for Group R is deleted.
	

	9-10
	502.5 Smoke barriers in Group I-1, Condition 2.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	OSHPD does not adopt this section.
	

	9-11
	503A.1 General. 
503A.1 General.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Amendment in existing Section 503A.1 is deleted since it is picked up by model code in Section 503.1. Last line of the first paragraph is deleted since it is inconsistent with rest of the subsections.
	

	9-12
	503A.3 Existing structural elements carrying gravity load.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Existing amendments are deleted since they are picked up by model code. Existing deletion of model code Exceptions is retained.	
	

	9-13
	503A.3.1 Design live load.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Section is deleted because it is a duplicate of Section 304A.1.
	

	9-14
	503A.4 Existing structural elements carrying lateral load.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Revise existing amendments to align with changes in 2024 IEBC.
	

	9-15
	503A.13 Voluntary lateral force-resisting system alterations. 
503A.13 Voluntary seismic improvements.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Model code Section 503.13 is updated with some of the existing amendments in Existing Section 503A.13 to align with changes in IEBC 2024. Existing Section 503A.13 is deleted in its entirety.
	

	9-16
	506A.1 Compliance. 506A.1 Conformance.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Amendments are repealed since they are picked up by model code. Reference to “Code Official" is changed to “Building Official”.
	

	9-17
	506A.1.1 Change in the character of use function.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Revise existing amendment, to adopt and print part of the model code language.
	

	9-18
	506A.3 Stairways. 
506A.3 Stairways.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Amendments are repealed since they are picked up by model code.
	

	9-19
	506A.5 Structural.
506A.5 Structural.
506A.5.1 Live loads.
506A.5.2 Snow and wind loads.
506.5.4 Access to Risk Category IV.
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Amendments in existing Section 506A.5 are repealed in favor of adopting model code Section 506.5.  Section 506.5.4 is not adopted because those provisions would not apply to an existing OSHPD 1 building or in conflict with other provisions in the code.
	

	9-20
	506A.5.3 Seismic loads (seismic force-resisting system).
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Reference to non-OSHPD 1 building occupancies is deleted and section references are corrected. Exceptions to this section are repealed.
	

	9-21
	507 HISTORIC BUILDINGS
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Section is deleted since there are no OSHPD 1 building classified as historic building.
	


ITEM 10
Chapters 6 through 15
Do NOT adopt Chapter 6 through 15 of the 2024 IEBC.
	OSHPD 06/24
ITEM 10
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	10-1
	Chapters 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14 and 15
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	OSHPD does not adopt Chapters 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14 and 15.
	


ITEM 11
Chapter 16 REFERENCED STANDARDS
Adopt Chapter 16 of the 2024 IEBC with new amendments in sections listed below.
	OSHPD 06/24
ITEM 11
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	11-1
	User note
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	References are revised to match with amendments in other chapters.
	

	11-2
	ASCE 7—2016
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Revised to include Supplement 3 for OSHPD 1.
	

	11-3
	ASCE 7—2022 
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Updated to match with reference in the CBC and 2022 edition of ASCE 7.
	

	11-4
	ASCE 41—2013
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Reference standard has been retained for SPC-4D and SPC-2 retrofits.
	

	11-5
	ASCE 41—2017 2023
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Adopt the 2023 edition of ASCE 41 for OSHPD 1, 1R, 2, 4 and 5.
	

	11-6
	ASTM A615—15ae1 22
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	Test standard has been updated to align with industry specifications.
	


ITEM 12
Appendices A, B, C, D, E and Resource A
Do NOT adopt Appendices A, B, C, D, E and Resource A of the 2024 IEBC.
	OSHPD 06/24
ITEM 12
	Code Section
	CAC
Action
	Agency Response
	Public Comments
	Annotations
	CBSC
Action

	12-1
	Appendices A, B, C, D, E and Resource A
	Approve
	Accept
	No public comments received.
	[bookmark: _Hlk168405350]OSHPD does not adopt Appendices A, B, C, D and E and Resource A.
	



BSC TP-123 (Rev. 2/24) Commission Action Matrix	December 9, 2024
OSHPD 06/24 - Part 10 - 2024 Triennial Code Cycle	CAM – Green
Office of Statewide Hospital Planning and Development	Page 1 of 1
